

AGENDA REQUEST FORM

Return completed form and complete agenda item to the Clerk of the Board
Yakima County Commissioners' Office, Room 232

Prepared by:

Chris Albert

Department: County Roads

Requested Agenda Date: 02/15/2022

Presenting: Matt Pietrusiewicz

Document Title:

In the Matter of Awarding Bid For Hot Mix Asphalt and Gravel Products for the Yakima County Road Department

Action Requested: *Check Applicable Box*

- PASS RESOLUTION EXECUTE or AMEND **AGREEMENT** CONTRACT or GRANT
 ISSUE PROCLAMATION PASS ORDINANCE OTHER _____

Describe Fiscal Impact:

Approximately \$260,000 of Road Maintenance Budgeted Material.

Background Information:

After opening bids following a two week advertisement, there is a need to purchase Rock and Asphalt products to conduct various maintenance activities throughout the 2022 fiscal year. The amounts of total product purchased will be determined by need within the road maintenance budget.


Summary & Recommendation:

Yakima County Engineer and Road Maintenance staff recommend the board of County commissioners award to all bidders.

Motion:

Department Head/ Elected Official

AGREEMENT Attached Is Approved as to Form
Corporate Counsel Initial



Signature

Late Agenda Requests Require BOCC Chairman Signature:

**BOARD OF YAKIMA COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
RESOLUTION**

**IN THE MATTER OF AWARDING BID
FOR HOT MIX ASPHALT AND GRAVEL
PRODUCTS FOR THE YAKIMA COUNTY
ROAD DEPARTMENT**

043-2022

WHEREAS, pursuant to Resolution No. 011-2022, dated January 18th, 2022 bid opening was set for February 2nd, 2022 at 2:00 p.m., or as soon thereafter as possible, in Room 419, Yakima County Courthouse, Yakima, Washington 98901; **and**,

WHEREAS, the Clerk of the Board of County Commissioners posted and published "Call for Bids" that specifications for said bid were available from the office of the County Engineer; **and**,

WHEREAS, the bids listed on the attached tabulation sheet were received, opened and publicly read; **and**,

WHEREAS, the County Engineer recommends that all bids be accepted; **now, therefore**,

BE IT HEREBY RESOLVED by the Board of County Commissioners of Yakima County, Washington that the bids for Hot Mix Asphalt and Gravel Products are awarded as shown on the attached bid tabulation sheet.

DONE **FEB 15 2022**

Amanda McKinney, Chair

Attest:

LaDon Linde, Commissioner

Julie Lawrence, Clerk of the Board *or*
Linda Kay O'Hara, Clerk of the Board

Ron Anderson, Commissioner
*Constituting the Board of County Commissioners
for Yakima County, Washington*

**BID TABULATION SHEET
YAKIMA COUNTY ROADS**

BID TIME: 2:00 p.m. DATE: February 2, 2022		Granite Construction Co. 80 Pond Rd Yakima, WA, 98901	Wapenish Sand & Gravel P.O. Box 919 Wapato, WA 98951	Wheeler Rock Products 250 Cowin Lane Wapato, WA 98951	American Rock Products P.O. Box 9337 Yakima, WA, 98909	O.L. Luther Co., Inc. 710 Luther Road Granger, WA, 98932	Central Pre-Mix 2000 E Beech St Yakima, WA 98901
Unit	Description	509 823 0641 KEITH MAJORS	509 877 7400 ALEX LONG	509 480 5773 NICK ZORZA	509 453 2063 JEFFREY KYLE HOPKINS	509 837 2527 ARNOLD LUTHER	509 731 9739 COLLIN BROWN
Ton	Hot Mixed Asphalt Class 1 1/2" PG 64-28	\$71.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$74.00	\$73.50	NO BID
Ton	Hot Mixed Asphalt Class 3/8" PG 64-28	\$71.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$76.00	\$73.50	NO BID
Ton	Crushed Surfacing Top Course	\$10.65	\$11.00	\$9.50	NO BID	\$12.75	\$10.50
Ton	Crushed Surfacing Base Course 1-1/4"-0"	\$10.40	\$11.00	\$9.50	NO BID	\$12.50	\$10.50
Ton	Ballast 2-1/2" - 0"	NO BID	\$9.75	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$11.60
Ton	Crushed Screenings Sealrock 3/8" - No. 4	\$15.50	NO BID	\$21.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$15.00
Ton	Crushed Screenings Sealrock 1/2" - No. 4	\$15.50	NO BID	\$14.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$15.00
Ton	Crushed Screenings Sealrock 5/8" - No. 4	NO BID	NO BID	\$14.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$15.00

TACK CSS-1
\$8.50 GAL